
Ponderous because it has to be. Authoritative take on a difficult topic 
 
Diversity. Equity. Inclusion. DEI – it is the mantra of the present generation. Richard Lynn, at something over 80 
the dean of living intelligence researchers, has been the bête noire of the politically correct since long before 
they invented the terms woke, cancel culture and the like. 
 
Lynn knows the literature in the field inside and out. He cites all of the significant authors and works, going out 
of his way to include references to the people who disagree with him. He treats them with courtesy, and 
politely points out where they err. 
 
The other authors tend to overlook inconvenient facts, sometimes perhaps by accident, but often in the 
interest of saving their careers. Steven Pinker pointed out two decades ago in his [[ASIN:0142003344 The Blank 
Slate]] how dangerous it is to hold wrong opinions on matters concerning intelligence. 
 
Lynn offer us a little bit of evolutionary history to explain why men and women are different. It applies as well 
to differences among human breeding populations, the topic of many of his previous books. The differences in 
intelligence between the sexes are much less significant among peoples whose evolutionary history did not 
lead through migration to cold climates and to agriculture. 
 
The hominid line remained in Africa long after it split from chimpanzees seven million years ago. Early on we 
learned to walk upright, use makeshift tools, throw things, and grasp things with our opposable thumbs. The 
hemispheres of our brains evolved to follow the right/left specialization of our hands.  We developed shared 
attention – the ability to have two people focus on the same object at one time with the intent of doing 
something or sharing knowledge about it. 
 
A couple of million years ago those hands started to use sticks and rocks as tools, then to chip primitive tools 
from stone. About the same time we tamed fire. New species of hominids continued to evolve, some of such as 
the Neanderthals and the Denisovans migrated into Eurasia. As their culture became more complex, there was 
an increasing need to pass acquired knowledge down to children by showing them how to chip stones, make 
fires, make dwellings and the like.  
 
One hundred and fifty thousand years ago, in other words, very recently, Homo sapiens evolved speech. Now 
we were able to communicate verbally about our objects of shared attention.  
 
Mothers were able to ask others in the tribe, sisters, older children and their own mothers,  for help with the 
children. With the help of others, women were able to bear children every two years instead of the six years’ 
spacing characteristic of ape mothers. Homo sapiens’ numbers grew. In this was presumably also the time at 
which the battle between the sexes moved to an oral battleground. Women were able to verbalize what they 
wanted.  See [[ASIN:0345408934 Mother Nature]] and [[ASIN:0674060326 Mothers and Others]]. 
 
Our numbers grew. Homo sapiens expanded north out of Africa perhaps 70,000 years ago. We pushed the 
other species of ape men into extinction in Eurasia. About 15,000 years ago we spread from Siberia to Alaska 
and populated the Western hemisphere. Simultaneously we initiated the New Stone Age, with a much broader 
stick, stone and bone toolset. We put handles on our axes, stone tips on our spears and arrows, invented bows 
and harpoons, started to make pottery, invented needles to make clothing and so on. 
 
We discovered that it was useful to drop the seeds of fruit trees and edible grasses along the way as we 
wandered. About 10,000 years ago we had advanced to the point where we could stay put and grow what we 
needed to eat. We started to settle in villages.This was the dawn of agriculture. We simultaneously learned to 
herd animals.  
 



Tribes had been so closely related that relaxed sexual practices of such as those of today’s tribal Africans, 
Indians and Eskimos didn’t matter. Our ancestors swapped partners with abandon. Any kid born was welcome 
to the tribe. Women seem to have liked it this way. Benjamin Franklin lamented that colonial women who were 
taken captive by the Indians very often didn’t want to return. 
 
With agriculture, paternity became an issue – a man wanted to leave something to his kids, and he wanted to 
be sure that they were his. There was a significant change in the relationship between men and women. People 
now came in contact with enough others that they became accustomed to dealing with strangers. The people 
around them were no longer close kin. They became wealthy enough that there was something to inherit when 
a man died. 
 
Women were now more often obliged to stick with one partner. That partner was the biggest choice they’ve 
made in life – his ability to provide determined her status and her well-being. Whereas tribal women can feed 
themselves by scratching the ground and growing yams, manioc and taro, women in agricultural communities 
in colder climes depended on their men for food and protection. It was of course reciprocal. Women played 
essential roles in growing, preparing, and cooking food, making clothes, tending the children and so on. 
 
The emergence of the patriarchy – man’s control over women’s sexuality and sustenance – meant that women 
had to persuade men in order to get what they wanted. As every man knows, they have evolved to be quite 
adept at this.  
 
This concludes my argument in concurrence with Lynn’s observation that sex differences in intelligence are 
greater among Europeans and Asians and among other human populations. 
 
The book includes a vast number of meta-analyses of scholarship by other researchers. It includes table after 
table of figures showing how averages between men and women differ by measurement after measurement. 
Though some differences are by absolute measure – such as the number of cubic centimeters and male and 
female brains – most of the differences are cited in standard deviations, a measure that may not be readily 
understandable to the average reader. Lynn’s graphics are useful in helping the reader understand what the 
numbers mean. 
 
This work is a milestone of scholarship, not merely the capstone of a long career of making his own 
contributions to the field of intelligence research, but a summary of the state-of-the-art in all of intelligence 
research.  
 
There have not been significant improvements in the techniques of statistical analysis over the past 20 years or 
so. The big new insights in intelligence research are more in the realms of genetics, epigenetics, nutrition and 
environmental factors such as pesticides and so on. In other words, one can be fairly confident that what Lynn 
is laying out here is not likely to change vastly any time soon to reflect new research. We will become better at 
explaining why it is, but what it is is well known. 
 
Two writers who have made significant recent contributions to the study of intelligence are Robert Plomin in  
[[ASIN:B08BT69SZK Blueprint]] and Richard Haier with [[ASIN:110746143X The Neuroscience of Intelligence ]].  
Though, as Lynn states, their stated opinions about sex diffences do not necessarily agree with his, their 
research would point the same direction. 
  
A five-star work. If Amazon gave awards for bravery he would get five stars as well for that. 
 


